CHERKE STREET		nme			ment eProc	urement	Syste					
<u>inni ePro</u>	cui	rem	ent	т	ender Details	6						
<u> </u>	yst	em						Da	te : 29-Oct-	2024	12:04 PI	
										I		
Basic Details		1										
Organisation Ch		Counci	l of Scientific a	and Industr	ial Research IIC	T-Hyderabad	I - CSIR	Purch	nase-IICT - (CSIR		
Tender Referenc Number	e	BDRM/	IICT/RD/002/2	24-25								
Tender ID		2024_0	CSIR_212898_	1	Withdrawal	Allowed	Y	'es				
Tender Type		Open T	Fender		Form of cont	S	Supply					
Tender Category	,	Service	es		No. of Cover	S	2	2				
General Technic Evaluation Allow		No			ItemWise Te Evaluation A		Ν	lo				
Payment Mode		Not Ap	plicable		Is Multi Curr For BOQ	Is Multi Currency Allowed						
Is Multi Currenc Allowed For Fee	Y	No			Allow Two S	Allow Two Stage Bidding			No			
	Ne	05.0										
Cover Details	Cov		<u> 19615 - 2</u>		Document Typ	10			Descriptio	0.0		
1			/Technical		.pdf				Technical t			
1	100/	PreQual/Technical			.pdf	•				Jiu		
							BSD Other tender related			ated		
							documents and forn					
					.pdf				documents	s and f	orms	
2	Fina	nce			.pdf				documents Price bid ir		orms	
2	Fina	nce			•						orms	
2	Fina	nce			.pdf				Price bid in		orms	
2 Tender Fee D			tal Fee in ₹	: * - 0.00	.pdf .xls	ee Details			Price bid in		orms	
	etail		tal Fee in ₹	* - 0.00	.pdf .xls 01 EMD Fe		0.00		Price bid ir Price bid D Exempt	n PDF	No	
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹	etail	s, [To t	tal Fee in ₹ Fee Payable		.xls <u>EMD F6</u> EMD Am	iount in ₹	0.00	All	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed	n PDF	No	
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption	etail 0.	s, [Tot 00 il			.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	ount in ₹ e Type		All EM	Price bid ir Price bid D Exempt	ion		
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption	etail 0.	s, [Tot 00 il			.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	ount in ₹ e Type	0.00 fixed	All EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent	ion	No	
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee	etail 0.	s, [Tot 00 il			.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	ount in ₹ e Type	0.00 fixed Nil	All EM EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed	etail	s, [Tot 00 il			.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	ount in ₹ e Type	0.00 fixed Nil	All EM EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s	etail	i <mark>s, [Tot</mark> 00 il 0		e At Ni	.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	ount in ₹ e Type	0.00 fixed Nil	All EM EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s	etail 0. N N	bDRM/	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN	.xls EMD Fee EMD Fee EMD Fee	e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil	AII EM EM Click t	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Descriptio Pre Qualification	etail 0. N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN ICAL TRIAL		e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil	AII EM EM Click t	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Descriptio Pre Qualification Details Independent	etail 0. N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN ICAL TRIAL		e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil	AII EM EM Click t	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Descriptio Pre Qualification Details Independent External	etail 0. N N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC, Please	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN ICAL TRIAL		e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil	AII EM EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Descriptio Pre Qualification Details Independent External Monitor/Remark Show Tender Va	etail 0. N N)	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC, Please	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN ICAL TRIAL		e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil	AII EM EM	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable	ion age At	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Descriptio Pre Qualification Details Independent External Monitor/Remark Show Tender Va	etail 0. N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC, Please NA	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN ICAL TRIAL documents.		e Type yable To	0.00 fixed Nil GANIZA [¬]	AII EM EM Click t	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable o view mod	ion age At	No NA Nil	
<u>Tender Fee D</u> Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption	etail 0. N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC, Please NA No	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN (CAL TRIAL documents.	.pdf .xls P] EMD Fee EMD Am EMD Fee EMD Pay	aount in ₹	0.00 fixed Nil GANIZA [¬]	AII EM EM Click t TION (Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable o view mod CRO) FOR (ion age At ificatio	No NA Nil	
Tender Fee D Tender Fee in ₹ Fee Payable To Tender Fee Exemption Allowed Work /Item(s Title Work Description Pre Qualification Details Independent External Monitor/Remark Show Tender Va	etail 0. N N	s, [Tot 00 il o BDRM/ EMPAN AN AC Please NA No No 0.00	Fee Payable	24-25 DENTIFYIN (CAL TRIAL documents.		e Type yable To ESEARCH OR	0.00 fixed Nil GANIZA ^T	AII EM Click t TION (atego d Of W aid Med	Price bid ir Price bid ID Exempt owed ID Percent ID Payable o view mod CRO) FOR (CRO) FOR (ion age At ificatio	No NA Nil	

Site Description Document Chiefa Dates 25-Oct-2024 02:00 PM Bid Opening Date 03-Dec:-2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale 25-Oct-2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Dec:-2024 01:00 PM Start Date 03-Oct-2024 00:00 AM Claffication End Date 03-Dec:-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission Start Date 03-Oct-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec:-2024 01:00 PM Tender Documents NT Document Documents Decument Name Decument NT S.No Document Name Decument Size (in KB) 1 Tender Document Size (in KB) Document Size (in KB) 1 Tender Document Size (in KB) Document Size (in KB) 2 DO Document Name Description Document 100 Document Size (in KB) 282 Document Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1109 2 DOQ Bid Opener Name Certificate Name Doulare Arcesh 3.	Should Allo	NPE	ern	ment		Allow Pi Bidder	referer	ntial	No					
Publish Date 29-Oct-2024 02:30 PM Bid Opening Date 03-Dec: 2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale 29-Oct-2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Dec: 2024 01:00 PM Start Date 30-Oct-2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale End 02-Dec: 2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission Start Date 30-Oct-2024 09:00 AM Clarification End Date 09-Nov-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission Start Date 26-Nov-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec: 2024 01:00 PM Tender Documents Nmme Decument Document Size (in KB) I Tender Document Document Document Size (in KB) I Tender Documents Document Document Size (in KB) I Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109 2 DOC BID Quereers List Tender Document 282 SNO Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Cartificate Name I Tender proc@csir.res.in Balaram mosund BALARAM MUSUNRA 2. dore.groc@csir.res.in Balaram mosund BALARAM		troc	ur ste	ement em		Biddei								
Document Download / Sale 29-Oct-2024 02:30 PM Document Download / Sale End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM Start Date 30-Oct-2024 09:00 AM Clarification End Date 09-Nov-2024 11:00 AM Bid Submission Start Date 30-Oct-2024 09:00 AM Bid Submission End Date 09-Nov-2024 11:00 AM Bid Submission Start Date 26-Rov-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 09-Nov-2024 11:00 AM Tender Documents S.No Document Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM NT S.No Document Submission End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM Work Item S.No Document Type Decument Name Decurrent Size (in KB) 122 Work Item S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tender Document Size (in KB) BOQ 234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Trender Gets extended to No. of days 1 2 7 Bid Openers List Sid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name	mente anti-				20 Oct 20	24 02.00						02 Dag	2024 02:20 DM	
Start Date Date Option Clarification Start Date 30-Oct-2024 09:00 AM Clarification End Date 09-Now-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission Start Date 26-Now-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PM Tender Documents Image: Comparison of Compariso											/ Colo End			
Bid Submission Start Date 26-Nov-2024 01:00 PM Bid Submission End Date 02-Dec-2024 01:00 PP Tender Documents NTT Document S.No Document Name Description Size (in KB) Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Tender document 109. Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Operics: res.in Bakesh Doure DOURE KNESH 2. doure oproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE KNESH DOURE KNESH 3. pd opence@csir.res.in MadeusUhan Duduku DUUDUKU MAPHUSUHAR Muku 4. ppodk.eproc@csir.res.in MadeusUhan Duduku DUUDUKU MAPHUSUHAR DOURE KNESH 5. GeMARPTS Details GemARPTS ID EPOVDZDITAXD		owind	au /	Sale	29-001-20	JZ4 UZ.30			nent Do	wiiioau	/ Sale Ellu	UZ-Dec	-2024 01.00 PM	
Tender Documents NT Document Description Document S.No Document Image: Size (in KB) Image: Size (in KB) Work Item Image: Size (in KB) Image: Size (in KB) Image: Size (in KB) Mork Item S.No Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 Bid Openers List Since (Berrificate Name Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madasudan Duduku DOURE VARCHERY 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Madasudan Duduku DOURE VARCHERY 5. More Description EMANNELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR	Clarification	Start	Date	e	30-Oct-20	024 09:00	AM C	Clarifi	ication E	End Date	e	09-Nov-2024 11:00		
NIT Document S.No Document Tendemotice_1.pdf Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tendemotice_1.pdf Etender notice 1127. Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Discurrents 1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 7 1. 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. 2 7 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 2 doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARM MUSUNRI 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARM MUSUNRI	Bid Submiss	ion St	art D	Date	26-Nov-2	024 01:00	PM E	Bid Su	ubmissio	on End [Date	02-Dec-2024 01:00 F		
NTT Document S.No Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Trendernotice_1.pdf Etender notice 1127. Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document 1 Trender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 7 1. 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name SNo Bid Opener Login I Balaram eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 1. 2 doure.eproc@csir.res.in Nadhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GemARPTS 10 EPCWD2D17AXD <td co<="" th=""><th></th><th></th><th></th><th></th><th>-</th><th></th><th></th><th></th><th></th><th></th><th></th><th>·</th><th></th></td>	<th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th>-</th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th></th> <th>·</th> <th></th>					-							·	
NIT Document S.No Document Tendemotice_1.pdf Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tendemotice_1.pdf Etender notice 1127. Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Discurrents 1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 7 1. 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. 2 7 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 2 doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARM MUSUNRI 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARM MUSUNRI	Tondor Do		onto											
SNO Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tendemotice_1.pdf Etender notice 1127. Work Item Documents S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. 2 7 7 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALRAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUNHA 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUNHA 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU			1	-									D	
Image: State of the s		S.No					Des	cripti	on					
SN0 Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Terration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 7 Bid Openers List SN0 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI DUDUKE NAKESH 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKE NAKESH DUDUKE NAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKE NAKESH DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details Gemarption EPCWD2D17AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 24 Valid Until		1	Tend	lernotice_1.	odf		Etend	der no	otice				1127.05	
S.No Document Type Document Name Description Document Size (in KB) 1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_234406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Terration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1 2 7 7 Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKE NAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKE NAKESH 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeeMARPTS Details GeeMARPTS ID EPCWD2D17AXD Description ENPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 24 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 2<	_													
1 Tender Documents 02.pdf Etender document 1109. 2 BOQ BOQ_233406.xls Price bid 282. Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Teration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender 1. 2 Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Balaram musunuri BalARAM MUSUNURI Dougle RAKESH Doure DOURE RAKESH DOURE RAKESH DOURE RAKESH DOURE RAKESH DOURE RAKESH Spokk.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUBUKU MADHUSUDHAH 4. spokk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative chart decimal Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart madel Disclose Bid Opening Places BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoQ Comparative Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain BoD Chart Rake REV Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public D		S.No	Doc	ument Typ	e	Document Na		me		Description				
Auto Extension Corrigendum Properties for Tender Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. 2 7 Bid Opener Login Id Belaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUNURI 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUNURI 5. md.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description ConductTing An ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report 2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain <td></td> <td>1</td> <td>Tend</td> <td colspan="2">der Documents</td> <td colspan="2">02.pdf</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td colspan="2">Etender document</td> <td>t</td> <td>1109.42</td>		1	Tend	der Documents		02.pdf				Etender document		t	1109.42	
Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name L. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2D17AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening Shart model Piaces No Show Tennee bid Sec Comparative chart decimal 2 Chart model Piaces <		2					1406.xls	5					282.0	
Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2 Chart model places No Show Frances BioQ														
Iteration No. of bids required for bid opening a tender Tender gets extended to No. of days 1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name L. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2D17AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening Shart model Piaces No Show Tennee bid Sec Comparative chart decimal 2 Chart model Piaces <														
1. 2 7 Bid Openers List S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name L. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL CONDUCTING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Phows allowed Yes Status Yes Status SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No Chart model places No No Chart model InduthoBratak	Auto Exte	nsion	Co	rrigendur	n Prope	rties fo	r Teno	der						
Bid Openers List E S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name L. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details EPCWD2DI7AXD Description CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2 2 SoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No Chart model DOTER Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA Undertaking <td< td=""><td>Iteration </td><td>No. of</td><td>bids</td><td>required f</td><td>or bid ope</td><td>ening a te</td><td>ender</td><td></td><td>Tender</td><td>gets ex</td><td>tended to N</td><td>lo. of da</td><td>ys</td></td<>	Iteration	No. of	bids	required f	or bid ope	ening a te	ender		Tender	gets ex	tended to N	lo. of da	ys	
S.No Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name 1. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparitive chart decimal places 2 SoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No No Chart model Didectaking 2 2 2 SoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No 0 Chart model	1. 2	2		-		-			7				-	
Sive Bid Opener Login Id Bid Opener Name Certificate Name I. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details Gemarker DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description Conducting and Academic CLINICAL TRIAL CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Ves Yes Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening 2 SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparitive chart decimal places 2 SoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No Chart model Jonge Agree No Social Status														
1. balaram.eproc@csir.res.in Balaram musunuri BALARAM MUSUNURI 2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAR 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Process allowed Show Technical bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in status Technical Bid Opening Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2 2 Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal 2 No Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No No TIA Undertaking Sorder Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TAL UNDERTAKING GEM	Bid Opene	ers Lis	st											
2. doure.eproc@csir.res.in Rakesh Doure DOURE RAKESH 3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Yes Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No Chart model Sorder Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PP-MII Order 2017 Agree	S.No	Bid O	pene	er Login Id		E	Bid Op	ener	Name			Certifica	te Name	
3. md.eproc@csir.res.in Madhusudhan Duduku DUDUKU MADHUSUDHAN 4. spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No No TLA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree 2	1.													
Image: spodk.eproc@csir.res.in Dharmendra Kumar DHARMENDRA KUMAR GeMARPTS Details EPCWD2DI7AXD EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening SoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 SoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Conder Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Agree Agree					1									
GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 Solo Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 SNO Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order I TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Agree												DHARMENDRA KUMAR		
GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 Solo Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 SNO Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order I TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Agree														
GeMARPTS ID EPCWD2DI7AXD Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Show Technical bid status Yes Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 Solo Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 SNO Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order I TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Agree	GeMARPT	S Det	ails											
Description EMPANELMENT for IDENTIFYING CONTRACT RESEARCH ORGANIZATION (CRO FOR CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering No Show Finance bid Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Finance bid Yes Show Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative Normal Chart model Places BoQ Comparative No Chart Rank Type Image: Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order Tender complying with Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017			ano	r	FPCWD2D									
Description CONDUCTING AN ACADEMIC CLINICAL TRIAL Report Initiated On 29-Oct-2024 Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Public Domain Yes Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Comparitive chart decimal places 2 SNO Undertaking No Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree							DENTIF	YING	CONTRA	ACT RESE	ARCH ORG		N (CRO FOR	
Valid Until 28-Nov-2024 Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid status Yes SoQ Comparative Chart model Yes BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Tender complying with Order S.No Undertaking to Order TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017	Description													
Tender Properties Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking No Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree	Report Initiated On 2													
Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order In TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Image: Comparison of the state of the stat	Valid Until 2				28-Nov-2024									
Auto Tendering Process allowed No Show Technical bid status Yes Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Stage to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree Image: Comparative of the state of the st	T 1 -		• .											
Process allowed Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 4gree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree		-			1									
Show Finance bid status Yes Stage to disclose Bid Details in Public Domain Technical Bid Opening BoQ Comparative Chart model Normal BoQ Compartive chart decimal places 2 BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Stage to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree Agree 1 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree 1				No	Show	Technica	al bid s	statu	5	Yes				
Status Public Domain BoQ Comparative Normal BoQ Comparative Daces BoQ Comparative L Form Based BoQ No Chart Rank Type Form Based BoQ TIA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM 2 PPP-MII Order 2017				Yes	Stage	to disclo	se Bid	Deta	ils in	Technica	al Bid Openir	ng		
Chart model places BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree				100								5		
BoQ Comparative Chart Rank Type L Form Based BoQ No TIA Undertaking Form Based BoQ No S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree				Normal	-	-	ve chai	rt deo	cimal	2				
Chart Rank Type TIA Undertaking S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order I TIA UNDERTAKING GEM 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree		Comparative L						No						
S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order I TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree							-							
S.No Undertaking to Order Tender complying with Order Reason for non compliance of Order 1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree														
1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM Agree 2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree	TIA Under	<u>takin</u>	g											
2 PPP-MII Order 2017 Agree						complying	with O	Order	Reaso	on for no	n compliance	e of Orde	r	
	1 TIA UNDERTAKING GEM													
					Agree Agree									

Page 3	of 3
--------	------

Government					
Tenderenvitinglauthonitynt					
Systematic / Chair BDRM					
Address	DIICT/ Chair BDRM CSIR-IICT UPPAL ROAD TARNAKA HYDERABAD				
-					
Tender Creator Details					
Created By	Madhusudhan Duduku				
Designation	JR SECT ASST				
Created Date	29-Oct-2024 11:54 AM				